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Welcome  to  STAR,  India’s  most  pioneering  and  significant
modern retailer for fresh food and groceries. At STAR, we are
committed to providing our customers with a wide range of
daily  essentials,  fresh  produce,  poultry,  and  a  host  of
exclusive TATA brands, all at great value.

With  48  stores  spread  across  Mumbai,  Pune,  Bangalore,
Kolhapur, and Hyderabad, STAR has become a trusted name in the
retail industry. But we don’t just stop at physical stores. We
have also embraced the digital age and are now the sourcing
partner for StarQuik, offering customers the convenience of
ordering groceries online and having them delivered right to
their homes.

One  of  the  reasons  why  STAR  has  gained  immense  customer
loyalty is our signature customer-first approach. We believe
in  putting  our  customers’  needs  and  satisfaction  above
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everything else. Our dedicated team works tirelessly to ensure
that every customer has a seamless shopping experience.

But our commitment to care and empathy doesn’t stop at our
customers. We also extend it to our employees. At STAR, we
have  a  diverse  workforce  with  a  special  focus  on  hiring
specially-abled  colleagues.  We  believe  in  creating  an
inclusive and supportive work environment where everyone can
thrive and contribute their unique talents.

STAR stores are available in two different formats to cater to
the diverse needs of our customers:

STAR HYPER:
STAR Hyper is our hypermarket format store that offers a wide
range of product categories. From food and grocery to fresh
produce, bakery items, beauty products, and home needs, you
can find it all at STAR Hyper. We also take pride in offering
a  wide  range  of  apparel  and  footwear  under  our  exclusive
brand, Zudio. Whether you’re looking for everyday essentials
or something special, STAR Hyper has got you covered.

STAR MARKET:
STAR Market is our supermarket format store, positioned as a
one-stop shop for fulfilling our customers’ monthly needs.
With a carefully curated selection of products, we aim to make
grocery  shopping  hassle-free  and  convenient.  From  pantry
staples to household items, you can find everything you need
at STAR Market. Our knowledgeable staff is always ready to
assist  you  and  ensure  that  you  have  a  pleasant  shopping
experience.

At STAR, we are constantly striving to exceed our customers’
expectations. We believe in continuous improvement and are
constantly innovating to provide you with the best shopping
experience possible. Whether you choose to visit our physical

https://www.zudio.com
https://www.starmarket.com/


stores or shop online, we are here to serve you and make your
life easier.

Experience the STAR difference today and discover why we are
India’s premier retailer for fresh food and groceries. We look
forward to welcoming you to our stores and serving you with
excellence.


